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Descript ion Specif ications

Custom Line Navetta 30, the super yacht with authentic traditional charm.The
Custom Line Navetta 30 embodies the spirited spirit of a true masterpiece, with
an avant-garde design conceived with reference to maritime tradition. The
smallest in the Navetta range, this superyacht features a displacement hull that
skilfully fuses seaworthiness, comfort, safety and customisation. With its bold
dimensions of 28.43 metres in length and 7.3 metres in beam, the Navetta 30
sails with an elegance and lightness that evoke grace and freedom, offering a
feeling of absolute well-being to its owner and guests.The exterior design of this
Custom Line stands out for its generous volume, balanced with elegant,
captivating lines. The horizontal layout of the exterior lines gives this yacht a
sleek, dynamic profile, while retaining a touch of timeless classicism. The lines of
the hull extend this dynamic forward, ensuring excellent performance while
optimising fuel consumption. In addition, the connection with the upper deck has
been improved to create a clear separation between the hull and superstructure,
creating two distinct areas united by a harmonious design.Inside the Custom
Line Navetta 30, harmony with the lines of the hull is perfectly achieved. This
mega yacht offers a series of stylistic innovations, particularly in the layout of the
spaces, allowing a fluid and coherent transition between the interior and exterior
spaces. Every detail is designed to optimise the use of available space and
volume. The design of the Navetta 30 is a perfect blend of modernity and the
codes of traditional boats. While retaining classic elements such as rounded
lines, window frames and the use of solid wood and brushed teak, a resolutely
modern approach has been adopted. For a more dynamic touch, the integration
of carbon details, varnished finishes, ultramarine blue striped fabrics and
personalised textures in quartz powder on fibreglass are omnipresent. This
combination lends a sporty, elegant look to this super yacht, while preserving the

YEAR

2025

 
LENGTH

28.43

WIDTH

0.00

 
DRAFT

2.20

FUEL TANK CAPACITY

14500

 
CABINS

5

HORSE POWER

0 X 1000 CV
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General

TYPE
motorboat

BRAND
custom line

MODEL
Navetta 30

Dimensions / Performance

FUEL CAPACITY (L)
14500

CRUISING SPEED (ND)
12

TOP SPEED (ND)
14

Building / facilities

HULL MATERIAL
GRP

AMOUNT OF CABINS
5

Engine room

NUMBER OF ENGINES HORSE POWER (CV)
0 x 1000

FUEL
Diesel
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