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Description Specif ications

Features- Simple, intuitive controls at the helm- Lightweight model for easy
storage, trailering and handling- Nook-style seating configuration of the cockpit,
optimized for socializing- M-Hull foundation offers better stability and
predictable handling- High attention to detail, fit and finish in premium stitched
upholstery and fixtures- Molded-in storage and cupholders- Award-winning
Mercury engine performance and reliability- Filler cushion turns bow into a sun
loungerStandard EquipmentCOCKPIT- Cup Holders x 9- Grab Handles x 4-
Mooring Cleats x 4ELECTRICAL- Battery Switch- Manual Bilge PumpHELM- Dual
Purpose Gauge: Speedometer, Voltmeter- 12V Accessory Outlet- 12V Horn- Side-
Mounted Engine Controls w/ Trim & Tilt Switch In Handle- Custom Sport Steering
WheelHULL & DECK- Bow & Transom Eyes (3)- 12V Navigation Lights- M-Hull
Design- Fiberglass Floor Liner- Single Helm Windscreen- Swim Platform w/
Telescoping LadderFactory Fitted Equipment- Solid Blue Hull- Bimini Top with
Boot- Snap-On Cover- Hydraulic Steering System- Bow Filler Cushion- Portside
Lounge Seat- Digital Depth Indicator- Waterproof AM/FM Stereo with Bluetooth-
Cockpit Flooring Grey Mat- Ski PoleUK Extras- UK PDI & Commissioning-
Commissioning KitTrailer Options- Euro Spec Roller Trailer R2/1600ELavailable -
4,650 inc. VATEngine Options- This boat comes complete with a Mercury F80
outboard engine. For river use, this can be reduced to a F30 outboard; please
contact us for the price reduction.DisclaimerThe Company offers the details of
this vessel in good faith but cannot guarantee or warrant the accuracy of this
information nor warrant the condition of the vessel. A buyer should instruct his
agents, or his surveyors, to investigate such details as the buyer desires
validated. This vessel is offered subject to prior sale, price change, or withdrawal
without notice.

YEAR

2024

 
LENGTH

5.19

WIDTH

2.32

 
ENGINE MANUFACTURER

Mercury

HORSE POWER

0 X 80 CV
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General

BRAND
bayliner

MODEL
Element m17

CURRENT LOCATION
Chertsey, uk

Dimensions / Performance

WEIGHT (T)
9999.99

Building / facilities

HULL MATERIAL
GRP

Engine room

ENGINE
Mercury

NUMBER OF ENGINES HORSE POWER (CV)
0 x 80
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